GENE RAL 781 Elmgrove Road Invoice No. PG000022629

Rochester, New York 14624-2991 Date: 7/31/2020
(800)836-8834 * Fax(585)328-8189 Due Date: 8/30/2020
A Member of the ICC Family of Companies Terms: Net 30
Customer No. EL1489

Bill To:

Town of Elsmere
Mr. John Giles, Jr.
11 Poplar Avenue

Wilmington, DE 19805

Supplement Project PO No.

Supplement No. 10

Quantity 36

ltem Billing Amount Tax Total
Code Analysis $349.00 $0.00 $349.00
Composition $111.00 $0.00 $111.00
Duplication, Finish & Handling $267.00 $0.00 $267.00
Shipping & Handling $15.82 $0.00 $15.82
$742.82 $0.00 $742.82

Payment/Credit applied:

Interest will be charged on all past due accounts at 1.5% monthly. Total Balance Due $742.82

This invoice was calculated using current supplementation rates and is subject
to General Code's Terms and Conditions which are available at
www.generalcode.com/TCdocs

Voucher Form (if required)
Claimant's Certification

| do solemnly declare and certify under penalties of the law that the within

bill is correct in all its particulars, that the articles have been furnished

or services rendered as stated therein, that no bonus has been given or
received by any persons within knowledge of this claimant in connection with
the above claim, that the amount therein stated is justly due and owing, and
that the amount charged is a reasonable one.

7/31/2020 Accounting Administrator

Account Charged Payment Record Check# Dated
Department Approval Date

Thank you for choosing General Code. We appreciate your business.



Valarie Strzempa

From: John Giles

Sent: Saturday, August 1, 2020 9:14 PM
To: Valarie Strzempa

Cc: Steve Martin; Diana Reed
Subject: FW: General Code Invoice
Attachments: PG000022629.PDF

Val,

Please process this invoice for payment.

John S. Giles Jr.

Town Manager

Town of Elsmere

11 Poplar Avenue
Wilmington, DE 19805
PH: (302) 998-2215
Fax: (302) 998-9920

From: Kim Panella <accounting@generalcode.com>
Sent: Friday, July 31, 2020 4:09 PM

To: John Giles <jgiles@townofelsmere.com>
Subject: General Code Invoice

Please see attached Invoice# PG000022629 due by 08/30/2020.
If you have any questions, please contact me.

Kim Panella
accounting@generalcode.com
800-836-8834 ext. 212



GENERAL 6/11/2020

' | Line#: 365592

TO: Diana Reed, Administrative Assistantto FROM:  Mary Beth Sullivan, Client Care
the Town Manager MSullivan@generalcode.com
diana.reed@townofelsmere.com

CLIENT: Town of Elsmere, DE RE: Supplement No. 10 Estimate
(EL1489)

Dear Diana,

Thank you for the opportunity to provide an estimate for your current supplementation project. Please
review the information below, providing any outstanding information that may be needed, then sign the
estimate and return it to us.

o

Source Files:

We have reviewed 2 pieces of legislation for an update to the Town Code.

Ordinance No. 647 does not need to be codified, but will be included on the Disposition List at the end of
your Code.

For a detailed listing of the included legislation, refer to the Appendix at the end of this estimate.

Supplementation:

General Code will codify and supplement the legislation listed above which includes but is not limited to:
» Analysis of the new legislation and proper placement in the Code
* Removal of repealed or superseded provisions

» Updates to the Officials Page, Table of Contents, Disposition List, Appendixes, Index, Histories,
Tables, Charts, and other items as necessary

» Review of statutory citations regarding the new legislation

 Any conflicts, inconsistencies, issues or questions identified at this point will be brought to the
attention of the municipality for resolution prior to publication

* Insertion of cross reference and editor's notes, as appropriate

+ Creation of instruction page for removing and inserting revised Code pages
 Printing of up to 36 sets of supplemental pages

* Update to eCode360

781 Elmgrove Road, Rochester, NY 14624 Toll Free: 800-836-8834 Fax: 585-328-8189 GeneralCode.com
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Town of Elsmere, DE 6/11/2020
Page 2 Line#: 365592

Price:

Between $710.00 and $790.00, which includes shipping and handling.

The final invoice will follow completion of the supplement.
. Any missing legislation received may result in additional costs.
- Any newly adopted legislation received after authorization for this supplement will be held until the

next supplement, unless otherwise noted.
Payment Terms:

Available upon request

Authorization:

To authorize the supplement, sign this ESTIMATE and FAX (585-328-8189) or EMAIL
(ezsu eneralcode.com) it back to us.

| authorize General Code to proceed with the supplement as outlined above. This order is subject to
General Code's Codification Terms and Conditions, which are available at www.generalcode.com/TCdocs.

Signature /// /% (e Date K v/

781 Eimgrove Road, Rochester, NY 14624 Toll Free: 800-836-8834 Fax: 585-328-8189 GeneralCode.com



Town of Elsmere, DE
Page 3

6/11/2020
Line#: 365592

Appendix
Legislation to be included in the code
Legislation Name

Ordinance No. 648
Ordinance No. 649

Legislation that does not need to be codified
Legislation Name

Ordinance No. 647

Adoption Date

03/12/2020
03/12/2020

Adoption Date
12/12/2019
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